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Druid 5 - Matt Black

Wood & Multi-fuel Stoves

All Henley stoves are designed to burn wood and smokeless fuels. Our design 

team invested considerable time to develop the unique combustion technology 

that is featured in the Druid range

It is one of the cleanest burning stoves in the world. Due to its triple tertiary air 

system, the combustion efficiency is one of the best in the world and it also 

enhances the visual effect of your lighting fire during 

the burn cycle, that enhances the visual effect of 

when the fire is light. In a nutshell you will always have 

a beautiful dancing flame. All our stoves are tested to 

the highest standard, we have worked closely with 

our testing partners in Kiwa Gastech UK

The laboratory commented that the Druid 5kW 

and Druid 8kW reached one of the highest rating 

of its class. The results out rated the leading stove 

manufactures in Europe. 

Our Commitment To 
The Environment

We strive to operate our business in an environmentally and socially 

responsible manner and work hard to ensure that our business operations 

have as little impact as possible on the environment and society.

Sustainability is a core part of who we are. We remind everyone we deal 

with – whether it be employees, suppliers or customers – that we like to leave 

things a little better than we found them. This forward-thinking attitude will not only help our business grow, but 

make the world a little better for all of us. More information on our commitment to the environment can be found 

on our website at www.henleystoves.com 



Available Finishes

The Thames multi fuel stove was designed specifically to fit un-
der a standard 16 fireplace opening. It is ideal for those awkward 
cast iron canopies or if you do not have much space on your 
hearth. Manufactured from steel with a cast iron door this stove 
boasts an efficiency of 79%.

Thames - Room Heater

Thames 4.5 - Matt Black

AVAILABLE IN 

4.5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

8kW
Output

Room Heater



Yale 4.5 - Matt Black

The Yale multi fuel stove was designed specifically to fit under 
a standard 16 fireplace opening.It is ideal for those awkward 
cast iron canopies or if you do not have much space on your 
hearth.It is also external air ready if your house requires this.
Manufactured from steel with a cast iron door this stove boasts 
an efficiency of 79%.

Yale - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

8kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Apollo 7 - Enamel Black

Henley Stoves best selling Apollo insert room heater stove is 
a fully cast iron stove with over 79% efficiency. Its convection 
based technology creates unrivalled constant warmth in your 
room.It will fit most standard 16/18″ fireplace openings. Also 
available in matt black.

Apollo - Room Heater - Insert

AVAILABLE IN 

5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

7kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Arklow 7 - Matt Black

The Arklow insert room heater stove is a new and improved ad-
dition to the Henley range. It is a fully cast iron stove with over 
79% efficiency. Its convection based technology creates unri-
valled constant warmth in your room. It will fit most standard 
16/18″ fireplace openings. Also available in enamel.

Arklow - Room Heater - Insert

AVAILABLE IN 

5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

7kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Druid 5 - Matt Black

The Druid 5kw/8kW multi fuel log box is the smallest of the 
Druid family range. The Druid range starts at 5kw and increases 
all the way to a 30kw boiler. and 14kW & 20kW double sided 
stoves It is constructed from high grade steel with a heavy cast 
iron door. It also has a double combustion system and cool to 
touch handle. The Druid 5kw is also Defra Approved.

Druid - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

14kW
Output

Double Sided

AVAILABLE IN 

16kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

20kW
Output

Double Sided

AVAILABLE IN 

21kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes

AVAILABLE IN 

5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

8kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

12kW
Output

Room Heater



Cambridge 7.5 - Enamel Cream

The Cambridge stove is a blend of traditional values with a 
modern twist. Its popular look and excellent cast iron build 
quality makes this stove an excellent choice for any customer. 
Boasting primary,secondary and tertiary air for excellent air 
control and an efficiency level of 77%. It is available in 3 sizes in 
5kw,7.5kw and 10.5kw in matt and enamel.

Cambridge - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

7.5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

10.5kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Ascot 7 - Enamel Cream

The Ascot stove brings the best of modern technology and 
traditional looks to the Henley range. This stove is external air 
ready if your house requires this but can be used as a standard 
stove also. This external air technology gives unrivalled air con-
trol allowing you to save more fuel than a standard stove.

Ascot - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

7kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Devon 7 - Matt Black

The Devon log box is a British inspired stove who have been 
world leaders in the stove industry for nearly a century. It 
is constructed of a steel body and comes as standard with 
external air if your home requires this. This allows for excellent 
air control which raises the efficiency level to over 80%.

Devon - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

5kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

7kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Eden 5 - Matt Black

The Eden 5kW Stove is another new addition to Henley’s 
Premier Collection of stoves.  Its superb cast iron construction 
and traditional design combined with modern technology, 
make this stove a popular choice for any customer.

Eden - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

5kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Aran 6 - Matt Black

The Aran 6kw multi fuel stove has been a Henley best seller 
from the beginning. Its beautiful traditional look makes it one of 
the most popular on the Irish market. Completely manufactured 
in cast iron,it is also available in a variety of enamel colours.

Aran - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

6kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Achill 6.6 - Matt Black

Henley Stoves best selling Achill 6.6kw insert room heater stove 
is a fully cast iron stove with over 79% efficiency. Its convection 
based technology creates unrivalled constant warmth in your 
room. It will fit most standard 16/18 fireplace openings.

Achil - Room Heater - Insert

AVAILABLE IN 

6.6kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



The Kylemore 7 is another recently introduced model to the 
Henley Stoves range. This stove is external air ready if your 
house requires this but can be used as a standard stove also. 
This external air technology gives unrivalled air control allowing 
you to save more fuel than a standard stove.

Kylemore - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

7kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



Skellig 8 - Enamel Brown

The Skellig multi fuel stove is another main stay of the Henley 
collection. Manufactured from high quality heavy cast iron it 
has been a best seller year in and year out. It is available in both 
a room heater and boiler in matt black and enamel.

Skellig - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

8kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



The Bracken 9kw multi fuel stove mixes both traditional looks 
and modern technology. Its double combustion system allows 
for great fuel efficiency along with excellent air control .Its 
separate ash door allows for easy cleaning. Also available in a 
choice of enamel colours.

Bracken - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

8kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



The Tullamore 14kw room heater stove is a heavy fully cast 
iron stove suitable for large living areas. Its traditional looks 
combined with modern technology makes it a popular choice. 
Its double combustion system gives excellent fuel efficiency at 
77%.

Tullamore - Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

14kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



The Skellig multi fuel stove is another main stay of the Henley 
collection. It is capable of heating up to 4 radiators and a hot 
water tank. Manufactured from high quality heavy cast iron it 
has been a best seller year in and year out. It is available in both 
a room heater and boiler in matt black and enamel.

Skellig - Boiler

AVAILABLE IN 

9kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



The Druid 12kw multi fuel boiler is the middle child of the Druid 
family range. It is capable of heating up to 6 radiators on the 
12kW, 13 radiators on the 21kW, 17 radiators on the 25 and 21 
radiators on the 30kW. The Druid range starts at 5kw and 
increases all the way to a 30kw boiler. It is constructed from 
high grade steel with a heavy cast iron door. It also has a double 

Druid - Boiler

AVAILABLE IN 

12kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

21kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

25kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

30kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



The Achill multi fuel Insert boiler is capable of heating up to 
9/10 single radiators on the 17.1kw and 13/14 single radiators 
on the 21kw. It will fit most standard 16/18 fireplace openings 
and is Constructed from steel with a cast iron door with an 
efficiency level of over 77%. It is thermostatically controlled 
which combined with both primary and secondary air allows 
for exceptional control.

Achil - Boiler - Insert

AVAILABLE IN 

17.1kW
Output

Room Heater

AVAILABLE IN 

21kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



The Achill 18kw boiler multi fuel stove is designed to heat up to 
10/11 single radiators. It is a steel stove with a cast iron door and 
efficiency level of over 77%. Its secondary air mechanism helps 
keep your glass clean for that lovely open fire look while adding 
warmth to your home. It also features a unique eco baffle boiler 
which creates extra boiler heat in comparison to a standard 
boiler.

Achil - Boiler

AVAILABLE IN 

18kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes



The Blasket 21kw boiler is ideally suited for most Irish homes 
and is capable of heating up to 13 radiators. It is a fully cast iron 
multi fuel stove weighing 240kg. It has a separate ash door 
for easy cleaning and is thermostatically controlled. It is also 
available in a choice of enamel colours.

Blasket - Boiler

AVAILABLE IN 

21kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes

Blasket 21 - Matt Black



Hampton 21 - Matt Black

The Hampton 30kw boiler is the only double door stove in the 
Henley range. It is capable of heating up to 21 radiators and a 
large room also.It comes with external air as standard if your 
house requires it. Like most other Henley models its double 
combustion system is unrivalled for huge fuel efficiency.

Hampton - Boielr

AVAILABLE IN 

30kW
Output

Room Heater

Available Finishes

AVAILABLE IN 

21kW
Output

Room Heater



Tech Specs

Druid 5kW 

Druid 5kW - Log Box

Druid 8kW 

Druid 8kW - Log Box

Druid 12kW 

Druid 16kW

Druid 21kW 

Druid 14kW - DS

Druid 20kW - DS

Druid 12kW - Boiler

Druid 21kW - Boiler

Druid 25kW - Boiler

Druid 30kW - Boiler

Height Width Depth Flue

548mm

780mm

578mm

770mm

623mm

650mm

680mm

625mm

628mm

623mm

680mm

685mm

732mm

405mm

405mm

520mm

520mm

595mm

632mm

660mm

590mm

590mm

595mm

660mm

660mm

740mm

320mm

320mm

386mm

386mm	

427mm

430mm

465mm

541mm

631mm

472mm

465mm

510mm

535mm

125mm

125mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

153mm

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

Backbox 
Height

Backbox 
Width

Backbox 
Depth

*** All stove measurments, stove drawings and boiler pipe drawing can be found on www.henleystoves.com
*** All information is correct at time of print however for more up to date information visit www.henleystoves.com



Tech Specs
Height Width Depth Flue

Cambridge 5kW 511mm 390mm 310mm 125mm

Cambridge 7.5kW 592mm 430mm 375mm 125mm

Cambridge 10.5kW 621mm 513mm 367mm 153mm

Braken 9kW 581mm 520mm 355mm 125mm

Aran 6kW 645mm 450mm 400mm 125mm

Oxford 7kW 553mm 450mm 375mm 125mm

Oxford 7kW - Log Box 790mm 450mm 375mm 125mm

Oxford 9kW 585mm 492mm 396mm 153mm

Oxford 9kW - Log Box 810mm 492mm 396mm 153mm

Achill 6.6kW 595mm 485mm 428mm 125mm

Apollo 5kW 595mm 485mm 320mm 125mm

Thames 4.5kW - Slimline 522mm 398mm 300mm 125mm

Apollo 7kW 597mm 485mm 425mm 125mm

Thames 8kW - Slimline 575mm 560mm 305mm 153mm

Blasket 21kW - Boiler 800mm 620mm 560mm 153mm

Skellig 8kW 690mm 540mm 470mm 153mm

Skellig 9kW - Boiler 690mm 540mm 470mm 153mm

Achill 17.1kW - Boiler 590mm 555mm 485mm 153mm

Achill 21kW - Boiler 635mm 626mm 535mm 153mm

Achill 16kW - FS

Achill 18kW - FS Boiler 650mm 615mm 445mm 153mm

Porto Stove Door 525mm 620mm - -

Ascot 5kW 505mm 399mm 374mm 125mm

Ascot 7kW 559mm 494mm 332mm 125mm

650mm 615mm 445mm 153mm

Backbox 
Height

Backbox 
Width

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

487mm

510mm

560mm

575mm

-

-

-

-

-

-

396mm

396mm

362mm

430mm

550mm

-

-

-

-

-

-

585mm

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

263mm

360mm

400mm

355mm

355mm

-

-

-

-

-

Backbox 
Depth

*** All stove measurments, stove drawings and boiler pipe drawings can be found on www.henleystoves.com
*** All information is correct at time of print however for more up to date information visit www.henleystoves.com

Tullamore 14kW 699mm 655mm 471mm 153mm - - -

*** All radiator estimates are based on a single radiator of measurement 500mm x 1190mm
*** Picture are for illustration purposes and some designs may have changed before going to print

All Henley stoves come with a 5 year 
warranty on the body of the stove.

European standard of test for stoves fired 
by solid fuel, Incorporating corrigenda 
September 2003, June 2006 and August 
2007

All Henley stoves come with an airwash 
system which helps to keep the glass 
clean. It uses a specially placed vent or 
vents to draw in air from the outside to 
which will wash over the front of the glass.

A Henley stove with this icon means 
that the stove is fully compliant with 
regulations for fully passive houses.

A Henley stove with this icon features 
a tertiary air system. This creates a 
cleanburn system where hot air is pushed 
into the firebox above the normal height 
of the fire. This allows the excess gasses to 
combust given a cleaner burn.

A Henley stove with this icon has an 
external air facility allowing the air to 
come directly from outside your building 
rather than through a vent in the room. 
This is required for heat recovery systems 
in new build projects.

A Henley stove with this icon are DEFRA 
exempt and have been fully tested to this 
standard. A DEFRA exempt stove can be 
used in a Smoke Control Area whereas a 
non DEFRA stove cannot.

A Henley stove with this icon is a boiler 
stove which comes with a termostat 
control. This regulates the amount of air 
released into the stove until it reaches the 
optimum temperature and automatically 
closes.

A Henley stove with this icon is approved 
for Smoke Control Areas. If you are in 
a Smoke Control Area then you can 
only burn authorised fuels (generally 
just smokeless fuels, although the list is 
available from DEFRA).

Yale 5kW 522mm 398mm 300mm 125mm

Yale 8kW 575mm 560mm 305mm 153mm

-

-

-

-

-

-

Arklow 5kW 591mm 499mm 352mm 125mm - - -

Arklow 7kW 591mm 499mm 439mm 125mm - - -




